ORDINANCE NO. 1791

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF GARDENA,
CALIFORNIA, REPEALING CHAPTER 15.04 OF THE GARDENA MUNICIPAL
CODE AND ADOPTING A NEW CHAPTER 15.04 WHICH ADOPTS BY
REFERENCE THE 2016 CALIFORNIA STATE BUILDING CODE WITH
AMENDMENTS; ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE INTERNATIONAL
PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE; ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE
UNIFORM BUILDING SECURITY CODE; AND ADOPTING BY REFERENCE
THE 2017 1L.OS ANGELES COUNTY FIRE CODE

WHEREAS, California Health & Safety Code Section 18901 et seq. provides that
the Building Standards Commission shall adopt a California Building Standards Code
(“CBSC”) based on specified uniform codes with input from various State Departmenits;
and

WHEREAS, the 2016 CBSC has been adopted and is codified in Title 24 of the
California Code of Regulations; and

WHEREAS, California Health & Safety Code Section 17922 provides that the
Department of Housing and Community Development is to adopt the CBSC and other
regulations; and

WHEREAS, the Department of Housing and Community Development has adopted
the most recent version of the CBSC; and

WHEREAS, California Health & Safety Code Section 17958.5 provides that a city
may make changes in the provisions adopted pursuant to Health and Safety Code
Section 17922 and published in the CBSC or other regulations upon specified findings;
and

WHEREAS, California Health & Safety Code Section 17958 further provides that, if
a city does not amend, add, or repeal ordinances or regulations to impose those
requirements or make changes, the provisions published in the CBSC or other
regulations shall be applicable to the city and shall be effective 180 days after
publication of the CBSC by the California Building Standards Commission; and

WHEREAS, the California Building Standards Commission adopted the 2016 Codes
to be effective as of January 1, 2017; and

WHEREAS, the City of Gardena contracts with the Los Angeles County Fire
Department and is required to adopt the most recent version of the Los Angeles County
Fire Code; and

WHEREAS, the County of Los Angeles has adopted the 2017 California Fire Code -
with amendments; and

WHEREAS, the City Goungil of the City of Gardena has determined that it would like
to adopt the CBSC by reference, as well as make certain amendments thereto; and




ORDINANCE NO. 1791

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Gardena has determined that it would
also like to adopt the 2017 Los Angeles County Fire Code by reference; and

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Gardena has determined that it would
also like to adopt the International Property Maintenance Code by reference; and

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Gardena has determined that it would
- also like to adopt the 1997 Uniform Building Security Code by reference; and

WHEREAS, prior to adopting this Ordinance, the City Council adopted Resoiution
No. 6309, making the necessary findings to amend the California Building Standards
Code;

NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF GARDENA,
CALIFORNIA, DOES HEREBY ORDAIN, AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 1. Chapter 15.04 of the Gardena Municipal Code is hereby repealed.

SECTION 2, Chapter 15.04 is hereby added to the Gardena Municipal Code to
read, as follows:

Chapter 15.04
General Building Provisions

16.04.010  Adoption of the California Building Standards Code

A. Subject to the amendments and changes set forth herein, the following Farts of
the 2016 California Building Standards Code as set forth in Title 24 of the
California Code of Regulations, are hereby adopted by reference in their entirety:

Part 1 — California Building Standards Administrative Code

Part 2 — California Building Code and the following Divisions and Appendices:
* Division It Scope and Administration to the CA Building Code
Appendix F - Rodent-proofing

Appendix H Signs

Appendix! Patio Covers

Appendix J  Grading

s 0 ¢ =

Part 2.5 - California Residential Building Code and the following Appendices:

. Appendix A Sizing and Capacities of Gas Piping

° Appendix B Sizing of Venting Systems Serving Appliances Equipped
with Draft Hoods, Category | Appliances, And Appliances
Listed for Use with Type B Vents

® Appendix C Exit Terminals of Mechanical Draft and Direct-Vent Venting
Systems

° Appendix D Recommended Procedure for Safety Inspection of An
Existing Appliance Instaliation




ORDINANCE NO. 1791

Appendix E  Radon Control Methods

Appendix G Swimming Pools, Spas and Hot Tubs
Appendix H Patio Covers

Appendix J Existing Buildings and Structures
Appendix K Sound Transmission

Appendix M Home Day Care R-3 Occupancy
Appendix N Venting Methods

Appendix O Automatic Vehicular Gate

e & £ e ©°o & ¢

Part 3 - California Electrical Code
Part 4 — California Mechanical Code

Part 5 — California Plumbing Code and the following Appendices:

. Appendix A Recommended Rules for the Sizing of Water Piping System

¢ Appendix D Sizing of Storm Water Drainage Systems

. Appendix G Sizing of Vent System

. Appendix{ Installation Standard for PEX Tubing Systems for Hot and
Cold Water Distribution

Part 6 — California Energy Code
Part 8 — California Historical Building Code
Part 11 — California Green Building Standards Code (“Cal Green”)

Part 12 — California Reference Standards Code

B. The most recent version of the Los Angeles County Fire Code, as set forth in
Gardena Municipal Code section 8.08.020, shall be part of the Building
Regulations of the City. [n cases of conflict between any provision between the
Los Angeles County Fire Code and the other provisions of the Building
Regulations of the City of Gardena, the most restrictive provision shall prevail.

15.04.020 Fees

The City shall charge fees for all permits, plan checks, inspections and other
services performed by the City relating to any portion of the Building Regulations of
the City or any other provision of Title 15 of the Gardena Municipal Code in an
amount set by resolution of the City Council.

15.04.030 Amendment of Part 2, California Building Code

A. Section 105.2, Building, 1 through 7, of Division li Scope and Administration, of
Chapter 1 of the California Building Code is hereby amended to read as follows:




ORDINANCE NO. 1791

1. One-story detached accessory building, provided the floor area does not
exceed 120 square feet, with three feet clear from a building or property line
and conforming to the zoning requirements of the Gardena Municipal Code.

2. [deleted]
3. [deleted]
4. [deleted]

5. Water tanks supported directly on grade if the capacity is not greater than
5,000 gallons (18,925 L) and the ratio of height to diameter or width is not
greater than 2:1.

6. Sidewalks not more than 30 inches (762) mm above adjacent grade, and not
over any basement or story below and are not part of an accessible route.

7. Painting, papering, floor and wall tiling — excluding showers and wet areas,
carpeting, cabinets, counter tops not containing pilumbing or elfectrical
fixtures, and similar finish work.

. Section 105.2, Building, 12 of Division Il Scope and Administration, of Chapter 1
of the California Building Code is hereby amended to read. as follows:

12. Window awnings supported by an exterior wall that do not project more than
54 inches (1372 mm) from the exterior wall, do not require additional support,
and are two or more feet from Property lines.

. Section 1203.2.1 of Chapter 12 of the California Building Code is herehy deleted
and a new Section 1203.2.1 is hereby added to read, as follows:

1203.2.1 Openings into attic. Exterior openings into the attic space of any
building intended for human occupancy shall be protected to prevent the entry of
birds, squirrels, rodents, snakes and other similar creatures. Openings for
ventilation having a least dimension of 1/16 inch minimum and 1/8 inch
maximum shall be permitted. Openings for ventilation having a least dimension
larger than 1/8 inch shall be provided with corrosion-resistant wire cloth
screening, hardware cloth or similar material with openings having a least
dimension of 1/16 inch minimum and 1/8 inch maximum. Where combustion air
is obtained from an attic area, it shall be in accordance with Chapter 7 of the
California Mechanical Code,

. Section 1203.4.1 of Chapter 12 of the California Building Code is hereby deleted
and a new Section 1203.4.1 and Section 1203.4.1.1 are hereby added to read,
as follows: '

1203.4.1 Openings for under-floor ventilation. The minimum net area of
ventilation openings shall not be less than one square foot for each 150 square




ORDINANCE NO, 1791

feet of crawl-space area. Ventilation openings shall be covered for their height
and width with any of the following materials, provided that the least dimension of
the covering shall not exceed 1/8 inch:

1. Perforated sheet metal plates not less than 0.070 inch thick.

2. Expanded sheet metal plates not less than 0.047 inch thick,

3. Cast-iron grilles or gratings.

4, Extruded load-bearing vents,

5. Hardware cloth of 0,035 inch wire or heavier.

6. Corrosion-resistant. wire mesh, with the least dimension not exceeding 1/8
inch.

1203.4.1.1 Openings for under-floor ventilation shall be not less than 1 1/2
square feet for each 25 linear feet of exterior wall. Openings shall be covered
with corrosion resistant wire mesh with mesh openings not less than 1/16 inch
nor more than 1/8 inch in any dimension.

. Table 1505.1 of Chapter 15 of the California Building Code is hereby amended
to read, as follows:

TABLE 1505.1"
MINIMUNM ROOF COVERING
CLASSIFICATION FOR TYPES OF CONSTRUCTION

TA IB DA | IIB [IDA|[IIB | IV | VA | VB

B | B |B[BY| B BN|B|B |BY

. Section 1507.3.1 of Chapter 15 of the California Building Code is hereby
amended to read as follows:

1507.3.1 Roof Deck requirements, Concrete and clay file shall be installed only
over solid sheathing or spaced structural sheathing boards.

. Section 1613.5.2 is added to Chapter 16 of the California Building Code to read
as follows:

1613.5.2 Structural Separation. Modify ASCE 7 Section 12.12.3 Equation
12.12-1 as follows:
C.6
(5 - d " max 12.12-1
MO T ( )




ORDINANCE NO. 1791

H. Section 1613.5.3 is added to Chapter 16 of the California Building Code to read
as follows:

1613.5.3 Values for Vertical Combinations. Modify ASCE 7 Section 12.2.3.1
Exception 3 as follows:

3. Detached one- and two-family dwellings up to two stories in height of light
frame construction.

I. Section 1613.5.3 is added to Chapter 16 of the California Building Code to read
as follows:

1613.5.4 Wood Diaphragms. Modify ASCE 7 Section 12.11.2.2.3 as follows:

12.11.2.2.3 Wood Diaphragms. In wood diaphragms, the continuous ties shall be
in addition to the diaphragm sheathing. Anchorage shall not be accomplished by
use of toe nails or nails subject to withdrawal nor shall wood ledgers or framing
be used in cross-grain bending or cross-grain tension. The diaphragm sheathing
shall not be considered effective as providing ties or struts required by this
section. For structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F, wood
diaphragms supporting concrete or masonry walls shall comply with the
following:

1. The spacing of continuous ties shall not exceed 40 feet. Added chords of
diaphragms may be used fo form sub-diaphragms to transmit the anchorage
forces to the main continuous crossties.

2. The maximum diaphragm shear used to determine the depth of the sub-
diaphragm shall not exceed 75% of the maximum diaphragm shear.

J. Section 1613.5.5 is added to Chapter 16 of the California Building Code to read
as follows:

1613.5.5 Maximum Sps Value in Determination of Cs and Ev. Modify ASCE 7
Section 12.8.1.3 as follows:

12.8.1.3 Maximum Sos Value in Determination of Cs and Ev. The value of
Cs and Ev are permitted to be calculated using a value of SDS equal to 1.0
but not less than 70% of Sps as defined in Section 11.4.4, provided that all of
the following criteria are met:

1. The structure does not have irregularitics, as defined in Section 12.3.2;
2. The structure does not exceed five stories above the lower of the base or

grade plane as defined in Section 11.2, and, where present, each
mezzanine level shall be considered a story for the purpose of this limit;




ORDINANCE NO. 1791

3. The structure has a fundamental period, T, that does not exceed 0.5
seconds, as determined using Section 12.8.2;

4. The structure meets the requirements necessary for the redundancy
factor, {1, to be permitted to be taken as 1.0, in accordance with Section
12.3.4.2;

5. The site soil properiies are not classified as Site Classes E or F, as
defined in Section 11.4.2; and

6. The structure is classified as Risk Category | or ll, as defined in Section
1.5.1.

K. Section 1704.6 of Chapter 17 of the California Building Code is amended to read
as follows:

1704.6 Structural Observations. YWhere required by the provisions of Section
1704.6.6.1 or 1704.6.6.2, the owner or the owner's authorized agent shall
employ a registered design professional structural observer to perform structural
observations. Structural observation does not include or waive the responsibility
for the inspections in Section 110 or the special inspections in Section 1705 or
other sections of this code.

The structural observer shall be one of the following individuals:
1. The registered design professional responsible for the structural design; or

2. A registered design professional designhated by the registered design
professional responsible for the structural design.

Prior to the commencement of observations, the structural cbserver shall submit
to the building official a written statement identifying the frequency and extent of
structural observations.

The owner or owner's authorized agent shall coordinate and call a reconstruction
meeting between the structural observer, contractors, affected subcontractors
and special inspectors. The structural observer shall preside over the meeting.
The purpose of the meeting shall be to identify the major structural elements and
connections that affect the vertical and lateral load resisting systems of the
structure and to review scheduling of the required observations. A record of the
meeting shall be included in the report submitted to the Building Official.

At the conclusion of the work included in the permit, the structural observer shall
submit to the building official a written statement that the site visits have been
made and identify any reported deficiencies that, to the best of the structural
observer's knowledge, have not been resolved. Observed deficiencies shall be
reported in writing to the owner or owner’s authorized agent, special inspector,
contractor and the Building Official. Upon the form prescribed by the Building




ORDINANCE NO. 1791

Official, the structural observer shall submit to the Building Official a written
statement at each significant construction stage stating that the site visits have
been made and identifying any reported deficiencies which, to the best of the
structural observer's knowledge, have not been resolved. A final report by the
structural observer which states that all observed deficiencies have been
resolved is required before acceptance of the work by the Building Official.

. Section 1704.6.1 of Chapter 17 of the California Building Code is amended to
read as follows:

1704.6.1 Structural observations for seismic resistance. Structural
observations shall be provided for those structures assigned to Seismic Design
Category D, E or F, where one or more of the following conditions exist:

1. The structure is classified as Risk Category Il or IV in accordance with Table
1604.5.

2. The height of the structure is greater than 75 feet above the base.

3. The structure is assigned to Seismic Design Category E, is classified as Risk
Category | or H in accordance with Table 1604.5, and a lateral design is
required for the structure or portion thereof.

4, Exception: One-story wood framed Group R-3 and Group U Occupancies
less than 2,000 square feet in area, provided the adjacent grade is not
steeper than 1 unit vertical in 10 units horizontal (10% sloped), assigned to
Seismic Design Category D.

a. When so designated by the registered design professional responsible for
the structural design.

5. When such observation is specifically required by the building official.

. Section 1705.3, section 1, of Chapter 17 of the California Building Code is
amended to read as follows:

1705.3 Concrete Construction. Special inspections and tests for concrete
construction shall be performed in accordance with this section and Table
1705.3.

Exceptions: Special inspections and tests shall not be required for:

1. Isolated spread concrete footings of buildings three stories or less above
grade plane that are fully supported on earth or rock, where the structural
design of the footing is based on a specified compressive strength, f'c, no
greater than 2,500 pounds per square inch (psi) regardless of the




ORDINANCE NO. 1791

compressive strength specified in the construction documents or used in the
footing construction.

N. Exception 3 of Section 1705.12 of the California Building Code is amended to
read, as follows:

3. The structure is a detached one- or iwo-family dwelling not exceeding two
stories above grade plane, is not assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E
or F and does not have any of the following horizontal or vertical irregularities
in accordance with Section 12.3 of ASCE 7;

3.1 Torsional or extreme torsional irregularity.

3.2 Nonparallel systems irregularity.

3.3 Stiffness-soft story or stiffness-extreme soft story irregularity.
3.4 Discontinuity in lateral strength-weak story irregularity.

0. Section 1807.1.4 of Chapter 18 of the California Building Code is amended to
read as follows:

1807.1.4 Permanent wood foundation systems. Permanent wood foundation
systems shall not be used for structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D,
EorF.

P. Section 1807.1.6 of Chapter 18 of the California Building Code is amended to
read as follows:

1807.1.6 Prescriptive design of concrete and masonry foundation walls.
Concrete and masonry foundation walls that are laterally supported at the top
and bottom shall be permitted to be designed and constructed in accordance
with this section. Prescriptive design of foundation walls shall not be used for
structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F.

Q. Section 1809.3 of Chapter 18 of the California Building Code is amended to read
as follows:

1809.3 Stepped footings. The top surface of footings shall be level. The bottom
surface of footings shall be permitted to have a slope not exceeding one unit
vertical in 10 units horizontal (10-percent slope). Footings shall be stepped
where it is necessary to change the elevation of the top surface of the footing or
where the surface of the ground slopes more than one unit vertical in 10 units
harizontal (10-percent slope). For structures assigned to Seismic Design
Category D, E or F, the stepping requirement shall also apply to the top surface
of grade beams supporting walls. Footings shall be reinforced with four No. 4
bars. Two bars shall be place at the fop and bottom of the footings as shown in
Figure 1809.3. '




ORDINANCE NO. 1791

RECOMMERND; a> b
h ¢ 20

STEPPED FOUNDATIONS
FIGURE 1808.3

R. Section 1809.7 and Table 1809.7 of Chapter 18 of the California Building Code
are amended {o read as follows:

1809.7 Prescriptive footings for light-frame construction. Where a specific

design is not provided, concrete or masonry-unit footings supporting walls of

light-frame construction shall be permitted to be designed in accordance with

Table 1809.7. Prescriptive footings in Table 1809.7 shall not exceed one story

above grade plane for structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F.
TABLE 1808.7

PRESCRIPTIVE FOOTINGS SUPPORTING WALLS OF
LIGHT-FRAME CONSTRUCTION * &

NUMBER OF FLOORS SUFPORTED | wIDTH OF FOOTING THICKNESS OF
BY THE FOOTING (inches) FOOTING (inches)
1 12 6
2 15 6
3 18 8°

For Si: 1 Inch = 25.4 mm, 1 foot = 304.8 mm

a.  Depth of faotings shall be in accordance with Section 1809.4,

b. The ground under the floor shall be permitted to be excavated to the elevation of the top of the footing.

¢, Inleriorsiud-beating-walls-shall-be-permitied-to-be supporied by-isolated foolings—The-feeting-width-and-length-shall-be
twicetha-width-shown-inthis tableand-{oolings-shallhe-spaced notmore than 6 fest on-center. Nol Adopted.

d. Sae Section 1908 for additional requirements for concrele footings of structures assigned to Seismic Design Category
C,B,EorF,

e. For thickness of foundation walls, see Section 1807.1.8,

f.  Foolings shall be permitted to suppott a roof addition to the stipulated number of flcors. Footings supporiing roof only
shall be as required for supporting one floor.

g—Plainconcrete foolings-for Group-R-3-ocsupansies-shall be permilted to-be 6-inches-thisk:

S. Section 1809.12 of Chapter 18 of the California Building Code is deleted and a
new Section 1809.12 is added to read as follows:

1809.12 Timber footings. Timber footings shall not be used in structures
assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F.

T. Section 1810.3.2.4 of Chapter 18 of the California Building Code is deleted and a
new section 1810.3.2.4 is added to read as follows; subsection 1810.3.2.4
remains:

10




ORDINANCE NO. 1791

1810.3.2.4 Timber. Timber foundations shall not be used in sfructures assigned
to Seismic Design Category D, E or F.

. Section 1905.1 of Chapter 19 of the California Building Code is amended to read
as follows:

1905.1 General. The text of ACI 318 shall be modified as indicated in Sections
1905.1.1 through 1905.1.8, and ACI 318, Section 18.7.5.

. Section 1905.1,7 of Chapter 19 of the California Building Code is amended to
read as follows;

1805.1.7 ACI 318, Section 14.1.4. Delete ACI 318, Section 14.1.4, and replace
with the following:

14.1.4 — Plain concrete in structures assigned to Seismic Design Category C, D,
EorF.

14.1.4.1 — Structures assigned to Seismic Design Category C, D, E or F shali not
have elements of structural plain concrete, except as follows:

a) Structural plain concrete basement, foundation or other walls below the
base as defined in ASCE 7 are permitted in detached one- and two-family
dwellings three stories or less in height constructed with stud-bearing
walls. In dwellings assigned fo Seismic Design Category D or E, the height
of the wall shall not exceed 8 feet, the thickness shall not be less than 7%
inches, and the wall shall retain no more than 4 feet of unbalanced fill.
Walls shall have reinforcement in accordance with 14.6.1. Concrete used
for fill with a minimum cement content of two (2) sacks of Portland cement
or cementious material per cubic yard.

b) Isolated footings of plain concrete supporting pedestals or columns are
permitted, provided the projection of the footing beyond the face of the
supported member does not exceed the footing thickness.

Exception: In detached one- and two-family dwellings three stories
or less in height, the projection of the footing beyond the face of the
supported member is permitted to exceed the footing thickness.

c) Plain concrete footings are Not Permitted in seismic zones D and E.
Supporting walls are permitted provided the footings have at least two
continuous longitudinal reinforcing bars. Bars shall not be smaller than
No. 4 and shall have a total area of not less than 0.002 times the gross
cross-sectional area of the footing. For footings that exceed 8 inches in
thickness, a minimum of one bar shall be provided at the top and bottom
of the footing. Continuity of reinforcement shall be provided at corners and
intersections.

11




ORDINANCE NO. 1791

| #anmlwdweumgs—ﬂ#me—steﬂes—eHessmm-hagM—aﬂé—eensmmd—wﬁh

W, Sections 1905.1.9 thru 19056.1.11 are added to Chapter 19 of the California
Building Code to read as follows:

1905.1.9 ACI 318, Section 18.7.5. Modify ACI 318, Section 18.7.5, by adding
Section 18.7.5.7 and 18.7.5.8 as follows:

18.7.5.7 Where the calculated point of contra-flexure is not within the
middle half of the member clear height, provide transverse reinforcement
as specified in ACI 318 Sections 18.7.5.1, ltems (a) through (c), over the
full height of the member.

18.7.5.8 — At any section where the design strength, 0OPn, of the column
is less than the sum of the shears Ve computed in accordance with ACI
318 Sections 18.7.6.1 and 18.6.56.1 for ali the beams framing into the
column above the level under consideration, transverse reinforcement as
specified in ACI 318 Sections 18.7.5.1 through 18.7.5.3 shall be provided.
For beams framing into opposite sides of the column, the moment
components are permitted to be assumed to be of opposite sign. For the
determination of the design strength, 0Pn, of the column, these moments
are permitted to be assumed to resuit from the deformation of the frame in
any one principal axis.

1905.1.10 ACI 318, Section 18.10.4. Modify ACI 318, Section 18.10.4, by
adding Section 18.10.4.6 as follows:

18.10.4.6 — Walls and portions of walls with Py > 0.35P, shall not be
considered to contribuie to the calculated shear strength of the structure
for resisting earthquake-induced forces. Such walls shall conform to the
requirements of ACI 318 Section 18.14.

12




ORDINANCE NO. 1791

1905.1.11 ACI 318, Section 18.12.6. Modify ACI 318, by adding Section
18.12.6.2 as follows:

18.12.6.2 Collector and boundary elements in topping slabs placed over
precast floor and roof elements shall not be less than 3 inches or 6 db in
thickness, where db is the diameter of the largest reinforcement in the
topping slab.

. Section 2304.10.1 of Chapter 23 of the California Building Code is amended to
read as follows:

2304.10.1 Fastener requirements. Connections for wood members shall be
designed in accordance with the appropriate methodology in Section 2301.2.
The number and size of fasteners connecting wood members shall not be less
than that set forth in Table 2304.10.1. Staple fasteners in Table 2304.10.1 shall
not be used to resist or transfer seismic forces in structures assigned to Seismic
Design Category D, E or F.

Exception: Staples may be used to resist or transfer seismic forces when the
allowable shear values are substantiated by cyclic testing and approved by the
building official.

. Section 2304.12.5 of Chapter 23 of the California Building Code is amended fo
read as follows: '

2304.12.5 Wood used in retaining walls and cribs. Wood installed in retaining
or crib walls shall be preservative treated in accordance with AWPA U1 for soil
and fresh water use. Wood shall not be used retaining or crib walls for structures
assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F.

. Section 2305.4 is add-ed to Chapter 23 of the California Building Code to read as
follows:

2305.4 Quality of Nails. In Seismic Design Category D, E or F, mechanically
driven nails used in wood structural panel shear walls shall meet the same
dimensions as that required for hand-driven nails, including diameter, minfimum
length and minimum head diameter. Clipped head or box nails and staples are
not permitied. The allowable design value for clipped head nails in existing
construction may be taken at no more than the nail-head-area ratio of that of the
same size hand-driven nails.

. Section 2305.5 is added to Chapter 23 of the California Building Code to read
as follows: ,

2305.5 Hold-down connectors. In Seismic Design Category D, E or F, hold-
down connectors shall be designed to resist shear wall overturning moments
using approved cyclic load values or 75 percent of the allowable seismic load
values that do not consider cyciic loading of the product. Connector bolts into

13




BB.

CC.

ORDINANCE NO. 1791

wood framing shall require steel plate washers on the post on the opposite side
of the anchorage device. Plate size shall be a minimum of 0.229 inch by 3
inches by 3 inches in size. Hold-down connectors shall be tightened to finger
tight plus one half (1/2) wrench turn just prior to covering the wall framing.

Section 2306.2 of Chapter 23 of the California Building Code is repealed and a
new Section 2306.2 is added to read as follows:

2306.2 Wood-frame diaphragms. Wood-frame diaphragms shall be designed
and constructed in accordance with AWC SDPWS. Panels shall not be fastened
to framing members with staples. Wood structural panel diaphragms used to
resist seismic forces in structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D,EorF
shall be applied directly to the framing members.

Section 2306.3 of Chapter 23 of the California Building Code is repealed and a
new Section 2306.3 is added to read as follows:

2306.3 Wood-frame shear walls. Wood-frame shear walls shall be designed
and constructed in accordance with AWC SDPWS. For structures assigned to
Seismic Design Category D, E, or F, application of Tables 4.3A and 4.3B of
AWC SDPWS shall include the foﬂowmg

1. Wood structural panel thickness for shear walls shall not be less than 3/8
inch thick and studs shall not be spaced at more than 16 inches on center.

2. The maximum nominal unit shear capacities for 3/8 inch wood structural
panels resisting seismic forces in structures assigned to Seismic Design
Category D, E or F is 400 pounds per linear foot (pif).

Exception: Other nominal unit shear capacities may be permitted if such
values are substantiated by cyclic testing and approved by the building
official.

3. Nails shall be placed not less than 1/2 inch in from the panel edges and not
less than 3/8 inch from the edge of the connecting members for shear greater
than 350 plf using ASD or 500 plf using LRFD. Nails shall be placed not less
than 3/8 inch from panel edges and not less than % inch from the edge of the
connecting members for shears of 350 plf or less using ASD or 500 plf or less
using LRFD.

4. Table 4.3B application is not allowed for structures assigned to Seismic
Design Category D, E, or F. For structures assigned to Seismic Design
Category D, application of Table 4.3C of AWC SDPWS shall not be used
below the top level in a multi-level building. Staples are not permitted in
Seismic Design Category D, E or F. The allowable shear values in Tables
2306.3(1) and 2306.3(2) are permitted to be increased 40 percent for wind
designh. Panels complying with ANSI/APA PRP-210 shall be permitted to use
design values for Plywood Siding in the AWC SDPWS.

14




ORDINANCE NO. 1791

DD. Section 2307.2 is added to the 2016 Edition of the California Building Code to
read as follows:

2307.2 Wood-frame shear walls. Wood-frame shear walls shall be designed
and constructed in accordance with Section 2306.3 as applicable.

EE. Table 2308.6.1 of the 2016 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to
read as follows:

TABLE 2308.6.1°

WALL BRACING REQUIREMENTS

MAXIMUM BRAGED PANEL LOGATION, MAXIMUM DISTANCE
SEISMIC STORY SPACING OF SPACGING (0.C.) AND MINIMUM PERCENTAGE (X) CF BRACED WALL
DESIGN | CONDITION (SEE | ¥ pon o PANELS FROM EACH
GATEGORY | SECTION 23¢4.2) WALE 1 FNES EHD OF BRAGED
Bracing mothod® WAL LINE
LIB DWE, WSP SFB, PBS, ROP, HRS, GB>Y
35- 0 Efﬁ?&?gtﬁ Ench end and < 25% 07 v.e. | Each gnd and £ 25- 07 o.c, 125 ¢
- Each end and
Aand B 350 :10 I’Eﬂ’ AC ! ach end amd £235'- 0 o.c. {Hach end and 4 25 ¢ o.c. 12- 6"
i <25-(ac. .
35- 0" NP Euch end apd < 25~ (1" o.c. | Bach end and g 25~ 0" 0.0, 126"
%’Q 35-¢” Ne Bacli end and < 25 07 o.c, | Bach end and 5 25% 07 o0, 12- 6"
c
. Each endand < 25 07 0.¢. | Bach end snd £ 25% 0" 0.¢.
= 35-07 NP (mointmum 25% of wall (riinimim 25% of wall 126"
=) leugth)® length)®
Sps < 0.50: Hach end and < |5, < 0.50: Each end and
2507 o.c. (minlmwm 21% |25~ 0" o.c. (mintmum 43%
of wall length)” of wall length)*
0.558,; <075 Bachend }0.5 58, < 0.75 Bach end
and €25- 0" o.c. (minf-  fand.<25- 0" o.c. (mintmum
Lah mar 329 of wall fength)® [59% of wall lenpth)®
DandE 25- 0" NP g0

073 < 85,: < 1.00: Bachend
and g 253"~ " o.c. {mini-
mim 37% of wall length)®

0.75 < 5y < 1.00 Fach end
ane <25~ & o.c. (minimum
75% of wall langth)

Sps > 1,00 Eachend and g
2507 o0, {minimun48%
of wall length)

Sps > LAXk Bach end and <
25 0 o.c. (minlmum
100% of wall Jengih)*

15




ORDINANCE NO. 1791

For 8L 1inch = 25.4 mm, 1 foot = 3048 mm.

NP = Not Permitted.

a, Thic table specifies minimum sequirements for braced wall panels along interior or exterior braved wall lines,

b, Ses Section 2308.6.3 for full deseription of bracing methods.

. Por Method GB, gypswm waliboard applied Lo framing supporte that ace spaced at 16 inchies oncenler,

d. The rexquined Jengths shall be deubled for gypsum board zpplied to only ane Ezee of a braced wall panel.

a. Percentage shown represents iba minimum amount of bmokng reqnired along the building length (or wall length if the stnictore has an icregular shape).

38 ) or larger members and spaced a maximun of 16 jnches op e Braced wall panel constretion types shal e m} iliin a bracedwall tine.

ves and spaced not more than 6 inclies op ceoter and

h, W8P steeathing shialf e s minfnwms of 152" Wick nailed with 8d comunoi placed 3/8 nches from paned ed
12 indches on cenlor along Intermediate framitg members.

FF. Section 2308.6.5, Figure 2308.6.5.1, and Figure 2308.6.5.2 of the 2016 Edition
of the California Building Code are repealed and new Section 2308.6.5, Figure
2308.6.5 and Figure 2308.6.5.2 are added {o read as follows:

2308.6.5 Alternative bracing. An alternate braced wall (ABW) or a portal frame
with hold-downs (PFH) described in this section is permitted to substitute for a
48-inch (1219 mm) braced wall panel of Method DWB, WSP, SFB, PBS, PCP or
HPS. For Method GB, each 96-inch section (applied to one face) or 48-inch
section (applied to both faces) or portion thereof required by Table 2308.6.1 is
permitted to be replaced by one panel constructed in accordance with Method
ABW or PFH.

2308.6.5.1 Alternate braced wall (ABW). An ABW shall be constructed in
accordance with this section and Figure 2308.6.5.1. In one-story buildings, each
panel shall have a length of not less than 2 feet 8 inches and a height of not
more than 10 feet Each panel shall be sheathed on one face with 3/8-inch
minimum-thickness wood structural panel sheathing nailed with 8d common or
galvanized box nails in accordance with Table 2304.10.1 and blocked at wood
structural panel edges. For structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D or
E, each panel shall be sheathed on one face with 15/32-inch-minimum-thickness
wood structural panel sheathing nailed with 8d common nails spaced 3 inches on
panel edges, 3 inches at intermediate supports. Two anchor bolts installed in
accordance with Section 2308.3.1 shall be provided in each panel. Anchor bolts
shall be placed at each panel ouiside quarter points. Each panel end stud shall
have a hold-down device fastened fo the foundation, capable of providing an
approved uplift capacity of not less than 1,800 pounds. The hold-down device
shall be installed in accordance with the manufacturer's recommendations. The
ABW shall be supported directly on a foundation or on floor framing supported
directly on a foundation that is continuous across the entire length of the braced
wall line. This foundation shall be reinforced with not less than one No. 4 bar top
and bottom. Where the continuous foundation is required to have a depth
greater than 12 inches a minimum 12-inch by 12-inch continuous footing or
turned-down slab edge is permitted at door openings in the braced wall line. This
continuous footing or turned-down slab edge shall be reinforced with not less
than one No. 4 bar top and bottom. This reinforcement shall be lapped-45-24
inches with the reinforcement reguired in the continuous foundation located
directly under the braced wall line. Where the ABW is installed at the first story
of two-story buildings, the wood structural panel sheathing shall be provided on

16




ORDINANCE NO. 1791

both faces, three anchor bolts shall be placed at one-quarter points and tie-down
device uplift capacity shall be not less than 3,000 pounds

2308.6.5.2 Portal frame with hold-downs (PFH). A PFH shall be constructed in
accordance with this secfion and Figure 2308.6.5.2. The adjacent door or
window opening shall have a full-length header. In one-story buildings, each
panel shall have a length of not less than 16 inches and a height of not more
than 10 feet, Each panel shall be sheathed on one face with a single layer of 3/8-
inch minimum-thickness wood structural panel sheathing nailed with 8d common
or galvanized box nails in accordance with Figure 2308.6.5.2. For structures
assighed to Seismic Design Categoty D or E, each panel shall be sheathed on
one face with 15/32-inch minimum thickness wood structural panel sheathing
nailed with 8d common nails spaced 3 inches on panel edges, 3 inches at
intermediate supports and in accordance with Figure 2308.6.5.2. The wood
structural panel sheathing shall extend up over the solid sawn or glued-laminated
header and shall be nailed in accordance with Figure 2308.6.56.2. A built-up
header consisting of at least two 2-inch by 12-inch boards, fastened in
accordance with ftem 24 of Table 2304.10.1 shall be permitted fo be used. A
spacer, if used, shall be placed on the side of the built-up beam opposite the
wood structural pane! sheathing. The header shall extend between the inside
faces of the first full-length outer studs of each panel. The clear span of the
header between the inner studs of each panel shall be not less than 6 feet and
not mare than 18 feet in length. A strap with an uplift capacity of not less than
1,000 pound shall fasten the header to the inner studs opposite the sheathing.
One anchor bolt not less than 5/8 inch diameter and installed in accordance with
Section 2308.3.1 shall be provided in the center of each sill plate. The studs at
each end of the panel shall have a hold-down device fastened to the foundation
with an uplift capacity of not less than 3,500 pounds.

EDGES SHALL MEET OVER AND BE FASTENED TQ

2-07MIN PANEL o pANEL SPLICE (IF NEEDED) ADJOINING PANEL
LENGTH / COMMON FRAMING

< e i
L |
. 3" THICK WOOD
b w&uc’ﬁ{lm PANEL a le——Bd COMON OR-GANANZED-BOX NALS AT & 0.G,
Q BHEATHING ON ONE FAGE-—— AT PAMEL EDGES FOIR SINGLE STORY AND AT 4% 0.0,
u AT PANEL EDGES FOR THE FIRST OF 2 STORIES
3 IMIN. 2x4 FRAMING. MIN, DOUBL
3 1STUDS REQUIRED
& p *HOR BOLTS PER SECT 308.6.5.1
= | sTuDS UNDER HEADER AS — T ANCH PER SECTION 2
= REQUIRED
S MINIMUM REINFORGING OF FOUNDATION, ONE #4
gOLD'DOWN PER SGEGTION BAR TOP AND BOTTOM OF FODTING. REINEORCING
303 6.5.1 SHALL BE LAPPED 45 24 INCHES MM,
|
SRR xS o
SRR R

For SI: | inch =254 mm, | foot = 304.8 mm.
2. For struciutes gsslpnsd o Selspic Deslgn Calegory P or B sheathed on age Mace with 15052 ndemtuimeonn Tk ess (11.9 men} wogd sirwcla yal panel sheathing.

FIGURE 2308.6 5.1
ALTERNATE BRACED WALL PANEL (ABW)

Where a panel is located on one side of the opening, the header shall extend
between the inside face of the first full-length stud of the panel and the bearing

17




ORDINANCE NO. 1791

studs at the other end of the opening. A strap with an uplift capacity of not less
than 1,000 pounds shall fasten the header to the bearing studs. The bearing
studs shall also have a hold-down device fastened to the foundation with an
uplift capacity of not less than 1,000 pounds. The hold-down devices shall be an
embedded strap type, installed in accordance with the manufacturer's
recommendations. The PFH panels shall be supported directly on a foundation
that is continuous across the entire length of the braced wall line. This foundation
shall be reinforced with not less than one No. 4 bar top and bottom. Where the
continuous foundation is required to have a depth greater than 12 inches, a
minimum 12- inch by 12-inch continuous footing or turned-down slab edge is
permitied at door openings in the braced wall line. This continuous footing or
turned-down slab edge shall be reinforced with not less than one No. 4 bar top
and botiom. This reinforcement shall be lapped not less than 15 24 inches with
the reinforcement required in the continuous foundation located directly under
the braced wall line. Where a PFH is installed at the first story of two-story
buildings, each panel shall have a length of not less than 24 inches.

EXUENT OF HEADER
DOUBLE PORTAL FRAME {TWQ BRAGED WALL PANFLS)
EXTENT OF HEADER
SINGLE PORTAL FRAME (ONE RRACED WALL PANEL) +

MIN. 1000 LB TIE-DOWN
DEVICE

N, 3%11, 25" NET HEADER -é? -%—,

& T0 10 bl TYPICAL FORTALFRAME
s GONSTRUCTION

FASTEN TOP PLATE TO HEADER WITH TWOQO FOR PANCL 8PLIOE (F

& ROWS OF 16d SIMKER NAILS AT 3 O.C. TYP, NEEDED) PANEL EDGES
) _ SHALL BE BLOCKED AND
OR G " 24 [N, OF PORTAL HEIGHT,
L SHOWN AND 3" Q.C, IM ALL FRAMING [STUDS, ONE ROW OF TYPICAL
&3 BLOCKING AND StLLS) TYP SHEATHING-TO-FRAMING
u —MIN. VWIDTH = 16% FOR ONE-STORY STRUCTURES NAILING 1S REQUIRED
: N, YWADTH = 24* FOR USE IN FIRSY OF TWO 8TORY| AT EACH PANEL EOGE,
STRUCTURES If 2%4 DOUBLE BLOCKNG
I3 USED THE 2x48 MUST
BE NAILED TOGETHER
M, 24 FRAMING WiTH {3} 16d $INKERS

¥y MN. THICKNESS ¥/a0oD a
STRUCTURAL PANEL SHEATH R a-—MIN, DOUBLE 2¢4 POST
M. 3570 LB TIE-DCOWN BEVICE (EMBED{)ED INTO
GONGRETE ANE HAILED INTO FRAMMNG [N e MIN. 1000 LB TIE-DOWN
ACCORDANCE YATH MANUFACTURER" s i DEVICE
RECOMMENDAT ONS)

SEE SECTION 2308.6.5.2-

For ST inch =254 mm, 1| foot= 3048 wmm, 1 pound =4 448 N,
2, Koy strugkures ostpned (o Selonic Design Cotepory D or X, sheathed on meface with 1537 i ch-minimitn.tikckaess (11.9 rm) wood steuctural panel sheathing,

FIGHRE 2308.6.5.2
FORTAL FRAME WITH HOLD-DOWNS (PFH)

GG. Section 2308.6.8.1 of Chapter 23 of the California Building Code is amended to
read as follows:

2308.6.8.1 Foundation requirements. Braced wall lines shall be supported by
continuous foundations. [Exception deleted.]

For structures in Seismic Design Categories D and E, exterior braced wall panels
shall be in the same plane verticaily with the foundation or the portion of the

18




ORDINANCE NO. 1791

structure containing the offset shall be designed in accordance with accepted
engineering practice and Section 2308.1.1. [Exceptions deleted.]

15.04.040 Amendment of Part 2.5, California Residentiali Code

A. Section R105.2, Building, of Chapter 1 of the California Residential Code is
hereby amended to read as follows:

Building
1. One-story detached accessory building provided the floor area does not
exceed 120 square feet, three feet clear from a building or property line and

conforming to the zoning regulations of the Gardena Municipal Code.

2. [deleted]

3. [deleted]

4. Water tanks supported directly upon grade if the capacity does not exceed
5,000 galions and the ratio of height to diameter or width does not exceed 2
to 1.

5. Patio Slabs, Walkways and Sidewalks on private property.

8. Painting, papering, floor and wall tiling — excluding showers, carpeting,

cabinets, counter tops not containing plumbing or electrical, and similar finish

work.

Prefabricated swimming pools that are less than 24 inches (610 mm) deep.

Swings and other playground equipment.

Window awnings supported by an exterior wall that do not project more than

54 inches from the exterior wall, do not require additional support, and are

two or more feet from property lines.

10.Decks not exceeding 200 square feet in area, that are not more than 30
inches above grade at any point, are not attached to a dwelling and do not
serve the exit door required by Section R311.4,

© o~

B. Section R301.1.3.2 of Chapter 3 of the California Residential Code is amended
to read as follows:

R301.1.3.2 Woodframe structures.

The building official shall require construction documents to be approved and
stamped by a California licensed architect or engineer for all dwellings of wood
frame construction more than one story in height or with a basement located in
Seismic Design Category Do, D1, D2 or E. Notwithstanding other sections of law,
the law establishing these provisions is found in Business and Professions Code
Section 5537 and 6737.1.

19




ORDINANCE NO, 1791

C. Table R301.2(1) of Chapter 3 of the California Residential Code is amended to
read as follows; all footnotes are deleted:

TABLE R301.2(1)
GLIMATIC AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA

amended Amen- | Amen- | Amen-
WIND DESIGN ded ded ded
GROU SEISMIC
Bpeed Frost MEAN
ND Topograp | DESIGN AR FREEZ-
4 Weathe | line | ANNUAL
SNOW hic CATEGO Termite® ING INDEX .
mph ring® | Dept TEMP!
LOAD o effects RY' s ¢
) h®
See Exhibit B
Zero | 85 No Dsor E |Negligib} 12+ | Very Heavy 43 No 0 60
le 24"

D. tems 1, 3 and 5 of Section R301.2.2.2.5 of Chapter 3 of the California
Residential Code are amended to read as follows:

1. Where exterior shear wall lines or braced wall panels are not in one plane
vertically from the foundation to the uppermost story in which they are
required. {Exceptions deleted.]

3. When the end of a braced wall panel occurs over an opening in the wall
below. [Exceptions deleted]

5. Where pottions of a floor level are vertically offset. [Exceptions deleted]

E. Section R301.2.2.3.8 is added to Chapter 3 of the California Residential Code to
read as follows:

R301.2.2.3.8 Anchorage of Mechanical, Eiectrical, or Plumbing Components
and Equipment. Mechanical, electrical, or plumbing components and equipment
shall be anchored to the structure. Anchorage of the components and equipment
shall be designed fo resist loads in accordance with the California Building Code
and ASCE 7, except where the component is positively attached to the structure
and flexible connections are provided between the component and associated
ductwork, piping, and conduit; and either: :

1. The component weighs 400 Ib or less and has a center of mass located 4 ft
or less above the supporting structure; or

2. The component weighs 20 Ib or less or, in the case of a distributed system, 5
Ib/ft or less.

F. Section R313.1 of Chapter 3 of the California Residential Code is deleted and a
new Section R313.1 is added to read as follows:

20




ORDINANCE NO. 1791

R313.1 Townhouse automatic fire sprinklers systems. An automatic

residential fire sprinkler system installed in Townhouses as follows:

New buildings: An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed throughout all

new buildings.

Existing buildings: An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed throughout

when the building area exceeds 3,600 square feet and when one of the following

conditions exists:

1. When an addition is 50% or more of the existing building area, as defined in
Section 502.1, within a two year period; or

2. An addition when the existing building is already provided with automatic
sprinklers; or

3. When an existing Group R occupancy is being substantially renovated, and
where the scope of the renovation is such that the Building Official
determines that the complexity of installing a sprinkler system would be
similar as in a new building.

. Section R313.2 of Chapter 3 of the California Residential Code is deleted and a
new Section R313.2 is added to read as follows:

R313.2 One- and two-family dwellings automatic fire sprinklers systems.

An automatic residential fire sprinkler system installed in one and two family

dwellings as follows:

New buildings: An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed throughout ali

new buildings.

- Existing buildings: An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed throughout

when the building area exceeds 3,600 square feet and when one of the following

conditions exists:

1. When an addition is 50% or more of the existing building area, as defined in
Section 502.1, within a two year period; or

2. An addition when the existing building is already provided with automatic
sprinklers; or

3. When an existing Group R Occupancy is being substantially renovated, and
where the scope of the renovation is such that the Building Code Official
determines that the complexity of installing a sprinkler system would be
similar as in a new building.

. Section R403.1.2 of Chapter 4 of the California Residential Code is amended to
read as follows,

R403.1.2 Continuous footing in Seismic Design Categories Do, D1 and D2
and E. Exterior walls of buildings located in Seismic Design Gategories Do, D1
and D2 and E shall be supported by continuous solid or fully grouted masonry or
concrete footings. All required interior braced wall panels in buildings located in
Seismic Design Categories Do, D1 and ‘D2 and E with plan dimensions greater
than 50 feet shall be supported by continuous solid or fully grouted masonry or
concrete footings in accordance with Section R403.1.3.4. [Exceptions deleted.]

21




ORDINANCE NO. 1791

L. Section R403.1.3 of Chapter 4 of the California Residential Code is modified by
deleting the exception for masonry stem walls.

J. Section R403.1.5 of Chapter 4 of the California Residential Code is amended to
read as follows:

R403.1.5 Slope. The top surface of footings shall be level. The bottom surface
of footings shall not have a slope exceeding one unit vertical in 10 units
horizontal (10-percent slope). Footings shall be stepped where it is necessary to
change the elevation of the top surface of the footings or where the slope of the
bottom surface of the footings will exceed one unit vertical in 10 units horizontal
{10-percent slope). For structures located in Seismic Design Categories Do, D+
and D2 and E, stepped footings shall be reinforced with four No. 4 rebars
minimum. Two bars shall be place at the top and bottom of the footings as
shown in Figure R403.1.5.

RECOMMEND: 5 > b
hg 't~

— S_— wczoe- MIN, 2-#4 HEBAR {T0P & BOTTOM)

R Sp— : fuorwm FLATE (T¥P")

™« GRADE
-4 \‘

STEPPED FOUNDATIONS

FIGURE R403.1.5
STEPPED FOOTING

K. Section R404.2 of Chapter 4 of the California Residential Code and all
subsections thereto are deleted.

L. Section R408.2 of Chapter 4 of the California Residential Code is amended to
read as follows; the exception remains:

R408.2 Openings for under-floor ventilation. The minimum net area of
ventilation openings shall not be less than one square foot for each 150 square
feet of under-floor area. One ventilation opening shall be within three feet of
each corner of the building. Ventilation openings shall be covered for their height
and width with any of the following materials provided that the least dimension of
the covering shail not exceed 1/8 inch:

1. Perforated sheet metal plates not less than 0.070 inch thick.

2. Expanded sheet metal plates not less than 0.047 inch thick.

3. Cast-iron grill or grating. '

22




ORDINANCE NO. 1791

Extruded load-bearing brick vents.

Hardware cloth of 0.035 inch wire or heavier.

Corrosion-resistant wire mesh, with the least dimension not exceeding 1/8
inch,

Dok

M. Section R501.1 of Chapter 5 of the California Residential Code is amended to
read as follows: '

R501.1 Application. The provisions of this chapter shall control the design and
construction of the floors for buildings, including the floors of attic spaces used to
house mechanical or plumbing fixtures and equipment. Mechanical or plumbing
fixtures and equipment shall be attached (or anchored) to the structure in
accordance with Section R301.2.2.3.8.

N. Section R503.2.4 and Figure R503.2.4 are added to Chapter of the Califorhia
Residential Code to read as follows:

R503.2.4 Openings in horizontal diaphragms. Openings in horizontal diaphragms
with a dimension perpendicular to the joist that is greater than 4 feet shall be
constructed in accordance with Figure R503.2.4,

PLYWOOD SHEATHING
DIAPHRAGM OPENING

METAL TIE 16GA, x 1 /2" x 40" MIN,, {4 TOTAL)
W/ 18-18d COMMON NAILS AS SHOWN

OR-

METALTIE 16GA. x 1 1/2° X {OPENING WIDTH + 4'-07) MIN,,
{2 TOTAL) W/ 24-16d COMMON NAILS

For Sl 1inch =254 mny, § foot = 3048 mm.

Blockings shall be provided beyond headers

Metal ties not less than 0.058 inch (16 galvanized gage) by 1.5 inches wide
with eight 16d common nails on each side of the header-joist intersection.
The metal ties shall have a minimum yield of 33,000 psi.

c. Openings in diaphragms shall be further limited in accordance with Section
R301.2.2.2.5,

T

FIGURE R503.2.4
OPENINGS IN HORIZONTAL DIAPHRAGMS

23




ORDINANCE NO. 1791

0. Lines 35 and 36 of Table R802.3(1) of Chapter 6 of the California Residential
Code are amended by adding a reference to new footnote i to read as follows:

TABLE 602.3(1)
FASTENING SEHEDULE—continusd

TEM | DESCRIPTION OF BUILDING ELEMENTS | NUMBER AND TYPE OF FASTENER? D¢ I SPACING AND LOCATION
Floor

. 3-16a bax (35 "= 0.135; or

24 |27 subfloor to jolst or glrder 2-16 common (37, x 0.162°) Blind and face nail

iy o n, o
25 |27 planks {plank & beam—floor & voof) g}gg iﬁrﬁlﬁo&(sﬁg‘}i% )fﬁuzl y At each bearing, face nall

3-16d common (311'2")( 0.16249

26 | Bard or ritn joist o joist I:é(.). 5%’{1{31 :ngﬁﬁa bor End nail

Nall each kaver as follows: 32 “n.6.

20d common {40,182 3; or at top and botlom and staggered.

10d bax (37:0.128%; or 24 “o.c. face nall at top and botlots
a7 Built-up gleders and heams, 2-Inch lumber |3 “x 0,131 “nalls staggered on opposite sides
Iayers An:
%:fgg ;g:lt(l‘f;u"r;(&l;é] 5)1;9021.')’. or Face nall at entls and al eacl: splice

3-3"% 0,131 “natls

1160 box (31 % 0.135); or
3-16¢ common (3 0,162 %; o

28 | Ledger sirip supporting jolsts or rafters 4-10d box (3" 0.128 %; or At each jolst or rafter, face nalt
4-3"% 0.131 "nails
20 | Bridging to Jolst 2-108 (3 "« 0.128% Each end, toe patl
SPACING OF FASTENERS
DESGRIPTION - NUMBER AND i
e OF BUILDING FLEMENTS TYPE OF FASTENER® D0 Edges | Stnporse ¢
(irches) {inches)

Wood strustural pansts, sublloos, reof and interior wall sheathing o framing and paticielivard wall shaathing to framing
{see Table R602.3(3) for wood strileturpl panet exteriorwall sheathing to wall framing]

. TR 6d common (2 "% 0.113) nail (subfloor, wall)* . f
0 - 8d cormen {24, %% 0.1319 nall (roof) 6 iz
a [P 8d common mll (2%, "% 01319 6 12
39 11’80“11".1" _Iﬁdconlmon(G.x(}.ltiS?nail; 6 12

Oter wall sheathing?

a3 | /2 “structural cellulosic fiberboard 1Y/, * galvanized roofing nail, '/ *head 3 B
sheathing dlmmeter, )
14, "stuelural colluloste 1%, " palvanized roofing nall, T ¢ " head diame-
M . 20 3 6
fiberhoard sheathing ter,
ity e N d 11/, " galvanized rooafing natl: staple galvanized,
3551y " gypsum sheathing 1 lf2 “long; 11/, "scrows, Type W or § 4 !
sy w d 1%, "galvanized roofing naik; slaple galvanized,
36 ° | ¥y "gypsum sheathing 197 “ Tong: 1975 "screws, Type W or § 7 7
Woork structural pansts, combination subfioor umdartaymentto framing .
3 e - 64 defortned {27 0.120 ) natl; or
37 |*/1"and less 8d commaon {2, 0,131 7 nall 6 12
Tpe pu 8d common {25 "3 0.131 9 nail; or
8 -1 8d deformed {217, "x 0.120°) nall 6 12
1y v qly s 10d common (3" x 6,148 ) nail; or
R 8d deformed (2, ” x 0.120) nall 6 12

For SI: 1 inch = 26.4 mm, | Eoot = 304.8 mm, 1 mile per hour = 0.447 mfs; 1 ksi = 6,835 MPa.

24




=

_oooL o

i

ORDINANCE NO. 1791

TABLE R602.3(1—contihued
FASTENING SCHEDULE

. Nails are smonth-common, box or deformod shanks except where othersvise stated, Nalls used for framing and sheathlng connsatlons shall have minlmum

average bending yield sirenglhs as shown: 80 ksl for shank diameter of 0.192 tach (20d common nall), 90 kst for shank diamators larger than 0.142 Inch but
not latgee than 0.1¢7 tnch. and 100 ksi for shank diameters of B. 142 {nch or lass.

. Staples are 16 gage wive and have a mintmtin '/jg-Inch on diameter crown width,

. Natls shall be spaced at not more than 6 iachies on center at sll suppoits where spans are 48 [nches or grealer.

. Four-foot by 8-feot ar 4-foot by 9-faot panels shall be appiled vertically.

. Spaclng af Fastenees nat included i this lable shall be based on Table R602.3(2).

. Where the ultfmate deslgn wind speed [s 130 wph or less, nalls for atlaching wood struciural panel roof sheathing to gable srd wall framing shail be spaced G

inches on center. Where the ultimate design wind speed Is greater than 130 mph, nelis for attaching pane! roof sheathing o irtermedlate supports shall bo
spaced § knches on conter for minimum 48-inch distance from ridges, eaves and gabls ead wails; and 4 Inches on cenler to gakle end wall framing.

Gypsum sheathing shall conform to ASTM C 1396 and shall be installed In accordance with GA 263, Fiberboard sheathing shall conform te ASTM C 208,
Spacing of fasteners on floor sheathing panel edges applies to panel edges supposied by framing members and raqulred blocking and at flaor perimelers only.
Spacing of fasteners on roof sheathing panel edgos apphies to panel edges supported by framing mentberss and required blocking. Blocking of roof or Hoeor
sheathlrg panel edges parpendleular to the framing members need not he provided oxcept as required by other provistons of this code. Floor perimeter shall be
supported by framlng members or salid blocking

Where  rfter Is fastoned to ap adfacent paratlef celting joist in sccordance with this schedule, provide dvo tos nalls on one side of the rfter and toe nails frem
the cellingjoist to top plate Inaccordance with this schedule. The toe aall on the opposlte side of the rafter shall not be required.

1. Use of staples in braced wall panels shall be prohibited in Seismic Design Catepory By, Iy, 01 D).

P. Footnote "b" of Table R602.3(2) of Chapter 6 of the California Residential Code
is amended to read as follows:

b. Staples shall have a minimum crown width of 7/16-inch on diameter except
as noted. Use of staples in roof, floor, subffoor, and braced wall panels shalil
he prohibited in Seismic Design Category Do, D1 and D2 and E.

Q. Table R602.10.3(3) of Chapter 6 of the California Residential Code is amended
to read as follows:

TABLE RG0Z.70.3(3)
BRACING REGUIREMENTS BASED QN SEISMIC DESIGN CATEGORY

LSRRG sorens * JNOSUM TOVAL LENGTH (FEET) OF BRAGED VIALL PANELS
L oAl LOAD REQIKRED ALONG EACH HRACED WALL LINES
v HRACEDWALL LINE SPACING < 23 PEET
Selznue Dasign GravadWitid no " ] WI’!‘.QS":-"E!":‘;HS, Moy | Hothads
it Slo1y Loation Levegh Beroaunt | Malkou GB PCP,;;I;S', - cs e,
1 25 245 5 1.8 1.4
it 5.0 5.0 58 ki 27
ki) 7.6 1.5 18 48 4.1
@ i 104 10 100 {4 5.4
%0 135 12,8 12,5 80 a8
[{] NP 1.5 158 3n 28
n NF s | 90 60 51
(owlotes anl) @ w NP 825 134 00 7
10 i 180 18.0 120 12
. 5o NP 725 284 1540 128
10 NP 6.3 (%3] 4.5 3.8
20 NP 126 e 18 it
30 NP 185 i8.0 115 1.5
40 NP Mo 2.0 1848 14
56 NP 00 6.0 22.5 151
1 wy 8 26| @B 5| L8 06
za por %5 o] 6% M| 26 34
e NP 83 165 #3 188 54 4.5
% A6 NP 440 220 +h6 220 1.2 iR}
2t NP 38 218 HEE 254 90 .1
18 NP 53 MR 53 NB 3.8 1.2
20 NP 105 NP 45 pE T3 6.4
Iy 30 NP 453 NP 158 D %3 0.5
g 40 NP 20 NP 20 MY ise 128
50 uld 263 NP w3 NP 188 16.0
0] NP 4 NP 3 NP 5.3 1.5
20 NP 45 NP +he DP 10.5 9.6
e NP 8 NE L8 NP 158 £34
40 g 250 Np 200 NP 210 LG
i NP 463 NE 353 M 26, 223
{continued)

25




ORDINANCE NO. 1791

, TABLE R&02.1 0.3gﬁ—comlnund
BRACING REQUIREMENTS BASED SEISMIC DESIGN CATEGORY

s0¥. CLASS DY

WALL REWOHT = 10 FEET JANIKUM FOTAL LENGTH{FERT) OF DRAGED WALL PANELS

10 PSF FLOOR DEAD LOAD
16 PSE ROOFACE WG DEAD LOAD REQUIRER ALONG EACH BRACED WALL LIHE®

HRAGED WALL LINE SPACING <25 FEET

Molhads
Se{::?{:gg?;mn Stery Localioh Brmﬁg&ﬁ L et L ratnoa ce ! %:s:,;{;’%' Heinod :%E':S:i
i0 NP 58 60 m;e s 20 17
20 NP 60 120 60 120 40 34
30 WP 58 180 98 |80 Ge 5.1
@ 40 NP o0 H0MH 8O 68
50 NP 450 001 45630 100 8.5
10 NE [T 68 NPy 44 18
w0 NE 420 Np[ AZONE] 00 17
D, W NiF 450 ME| 180 NE! 135 1.5
10 NP 9 NP 26 NP 18,8 15.3
50 NP 400 N 306 NE| 228 9.1
10 NP &5 NP 35 Np| 60 X!
20 NP 0 N ewp| 26 192
30 MNP 265 NP 266 NE 188 15.1
4 NP HO NP 46 N 24.0 204
5 ue 436 Np| ety W0 255
18 NP [ [T 38
] NP O Ne 420 NP 9.0 11
D, 30 NP 480 NEi 430 NP| 134 L5
40 NP 246 NP 0 NP 130 153
50 NP a0 NPl 300 MR 228 9.1
[ NP 85 Np 85 NE 6.0 EX
20 NP 128 He | HenEl 120 i0.2
30 NP 55 i 256 NE 18,0 153
10 NP HO NP 48 NP 4.0 204
50 NP 245 §p] 426 NP] 300 255
10 NP P B TS a5 21
20 NP 80 68| B-16n| 50 43
30 NP Rg- M9 ERG-20 14 6.4
@ 40 NP o pal  sS-3p| 100 85
50 NP 208~ 409 0d-d08) 125 106
10 NP 5 N ¥5 NEf 55 £7
20 NP %06 NP 50 NE|  FLD 94
0 NP 25 NRI 225 NP| 65 140
10 NP 368 NP 304 NPE 220 187
it} NP 35 NP %5 HP 1.5 234
Dz 1) NF NP N NP NP
20 NP Ny NP MNP NP
30 NP NP WP HP NP
10 NP NP NP 3y Ny
50 NP Ng g NP N#t
i0 NP NP NP 745 Gk
) 20 NP NP NP 150 12.8
Lokt vl B e wo | |oms |
10 Np NP NP 300 25.5
50 NP NP Np 315 358

. Livearinteipolation shalt be peemittel,

b, VWall bracing Fengths are based on 5 soil site class "B" Intzgpolation of biocing fength betwess the S values ascociated whill the solsmic destgn catogores
shaltbe permslited swhen 4 ie-specifie Sy, value is determined In accardsnco with Section 16133 of the Infermaticnal Buitding Cede.

¢, Whene tho braced wall llne lengTh b greater Uian 59 feel, braced wall Bevs shall be peemltied 10 ke divided Jnto shortzr segmerats having bengihs of 80 feet or
st and the amount oF bracing within each segnient 313 be 1o socordance with s table,

4, h¥ethod LB stal! bave gypaum board Fastenzd to nat less than ene side with malls or screws In aceordance with Table RBO2A{1) for exiersor sleziling vr
Talde RI02.2.5 for ttestor gypsum boank Spactiss of fusteners at panel edgas shall ot excesd B jnches.

. Melhod CS-SFD doas not apply dn Seismle Déslgo Categories By, Dy and D).

I Methads GB and PCP braced wail panel hivy 1atie shall not gyeed 1:1 0 SDC Dy, B, of By, Methods PWE, 888, PHS. end HPS art kol pamitied in $00

26




ORDINANCE NO. 1791

R. Table R602.10.4 of Chapter 6 of the California Residential Code is amended to
read as follows:

TABLE Ra02.104
BAAGING METHODS
CONNECTIGN CRITERA"
METHODS, MATERIAL | MINIUN THICKNESS FIGUIRE .
Faatonoere Spacing
134 wood of Wood: 2-8d convnon nails Woud: par sid aad
- approved metaf strups S - or 3 top and battom plales
e i -8 {2, fon & 0§ 13 dia nails
Letin bracing ald5° 1o 60 angh_’..sinr EH j “I“ I Hfﬂ i 3-8d {2, buny & 0 137 din) nails
maximun 16 L el Melat:
slud spacing Metal steap: por massfactucer per manufactarer
DWE %1% nominal) for L 2-8d (2, long » 0,113 din) nails
Thagonal maximum 24~ of Per sud
wood boards slad spacing 2. 1¥," long stoples
Wsp 4 connon (2112'50.131) els -Eﬂmat—&wﬂmﬁﬂ— §" oddgas 12 feld
Weod e Eﬁﬂ@ﬂmﬂ&@mlﬁm Falte-REU2ALL-
siructural panel ~ sl 111131 1V 1 ]
i i ; 2 Sdcolniann (212501311 als ras-hy-Fastenes-
(Seo Soction REOH) i SloommIZX0IDm . e s | W
! 6 "edges 27 feld |
BV IVSE
Woed Structural 4 at panel edges
Panels with Stone 1 e B " Iy a1 12 at intermediale
o Masonry Vencer e See Figure R602.10.6.5 8 comumon (27,7 < 0,131) nails supports 4 at braced
k= {50e Section wall punel end posts
S | R6021065
if, o o _ [it," long 6,127 dia. (for " thick
£ Strecral 1" o P for e sheathing) 4" long % (112" din.
# fberboard s;}ealh- maxipwum 167 mmm” B ] {for B3, thick shcathmu) 3" edaes 6 ficld
A v ing st spacing 2 et palvanked rooliag nails or ¥d common
g 2 (24" Tong » 0.131 " dia,) oails
%‘ Nails vt screws per Table RE02.3003 For {Fos all braced wall
! . ' axterior lncations panct lorations: 77
~ ' N alges fncluding o
Gypsum boawd ! Naifs or screws per Tible R702,3.5 for ';ﬂ;kbi‘.;{l(l\; pl m‘;; g,
inierior locatinns fickd
PEBS 55 ¢ or . * for \ For ', 6 conuisoi
i £ ? e w g e
Palmcletgoard s 16° {1 [ong * 0,113 ding} nails 3* pilnes 67 field
sheathiing stuet f For ',", §d conunon
(See Seclian R605) stud spacing ol long % 0. 131 dlin.) vails
PCP Sea Soction L7036 for e 17,7 Tong, 11 ange, '/, " div, head nails |, "
Portfamd mukiewin 167 I“mlm[ : ] or f’n D;L"?sn Al raniing
vomaent plaster stud spacing :'_ ﬁ L 1. long, 16 gege staples o
11 33 ST . " 0.002" din., 02257 dia. head nails with ‘
Hardhoard he f::r 31:? x“_?"{:\ 16 length 10 accommodate 1Y, 47 edaes 87 field
ranel siding ta Spacing penetstion inlo studs :
ABW o <
4 ’ " ” Sec
Altenage " j See Section R602.10.6.1 . "
Mnate I Section REO210.6.1

{contined}

27




ORDINANCE NO. 1791

TABLE R§02,10.4—continued
BRACING METHODS |
CONHEGTION CRITERIA"
METHUDS, MATERIAL RUNIMLM THIGKNESS FIGURE
Fastoners Spacing
3 PFH e
£ | Podalimme with U I H See Section R602.1062 | See Section REO2.10.6.2
< hold-downs i
5
a
2]
5 PG 7 Sec Section REOLIOES | See Section R6D2.10.6.5
E Porat freme at gurage 1 * " S U
y
2
fd cgmmen (2 12230131 ) Dalls Exteriorshenthing-per— L raa
CS-IWSP 316" echye distarce to parielestoe  pabt REAI S 6" edges 12" field
Continuously sheathed g I NER 1R - -
wood structural panet L 80l comon (2 142°%0.3 ngiig. || oteriorshenthing-per— Vadesby fasioner
. o 38" clis distarce to penel eds Fibie ROU23H-or GG " ary

- 6 edges 127 eld —
i csG*
£ | Continuausly sheathad
£ | wood suuetural panel g See Method CS-WSP Bee Method CS-WSP
] adgacent to parnge n
= . - 1542
,g OpCoIngs .
b =
] C5-FF 7 ‘
“ | Contintously sheathed T See Section R602.10.6.4 See Section RAG2.10.64
§ portaf frame 15832"
= 1%, Jong % 0.12* din.
g {for 7, thick sheshing)
o CE.SFB Yoor®, for 13,7 long % 0,12 din.

Continneusiy sheaild b 16 {Tor 2y, thick shemblng) 3 edges 6" fivkd

strucleay fiberhoard stud spacing galvanizad oofing naks or

8d common
{2'1,”" long = L.131 “dia.) nails

For St 1 inch =254 mm, i oot = 303 mm. § degree = G175 rad, | gound por sqeare foot = 47.8 Mm%, 1 mile per Bour = VA47 ms.,

a. Adlesive atlackment of wall sheathing. Including Methad G, shall not b permitted In Selsmic Deslgn Categores G, Ty, By and Dy

k. &pplies o panels next In gampe door opening where supporing gable end wall of roof foad only. Shall enly be used on one wall of the garage. kn Setsntc
Deslgn Categories Dy, Iy and Dy, roof covering dedd Joad shall not exceed 3pst.

¢. Garage openings adjscent to a Method CS-G panel shall be provided with a header in accowdame with Toble RODZ.H(L). A full-helght clear opening shall not
be permhited adjacent to a Methad C5-G panzl,

d. Method CS-SEB daes oot apply in Selsmic Design Categaries Dy, Dy and D,

0. Methiod applies to detached one- put two-family dweblings tn Setsmie Dasign Categarles Dy theough Dy oty

£, Meihods GB and PP braced wall pruod how ratio shall nof excced 1:) in SDC Dy, By, o D, Methods LIB. DWB, 5FB, PBS. HI'S, aud PEG bre ot

permilted in SDC Dy, 1), or D,
g, Ve of slaples I braced watl panets shall be probibited In SDC Dy, By ot D,

28




ORDINANCE NO. 1791

S. Figure R602.10.6.1 of Chapter 6 of the California Residential Code is amended
to read as follows:

PANEL LERGTHPER
TARLE H602 10,

Q/—

BRACED YWALL #ANEL HEIGHT

15432"

NN 24000
STRUGCTURAL FANEL

SHEATHIHS OM ONE FACE e,

NI 3 5 d FR ARG MIE

POURLE STUD3 REGUIRm\\

2YHOLD-DOWH OR (2) STRAP-TYPE
AMCHORS PER TABLE RE02.40.5.1 {ON
OF BACH SHOWN FOR CLARITY)
STRAP-TYPE AMCHORS SHALL BE
PERIMTTED TO BE ATTACHED OVER
THE WOOD STRUCTURAL PAMEL

PANEL MUST BE ATTACHED
TO GOHNCRETE £ OUTING OR
COMCRETE FOUNDATION

WALL CONFINUQUS OVER "~

BRACED WALL LINE

~3

1(2) 92 DIAMETER ANCHOR

BOLTS LOCATED HETWEEM
6' AMD 12 OFf EACHEND OF
THE SEGMEMT

FIGURE R602.10.6.1
METHOD ABW-~ALTERNATE BRACED WALL PANEL

29

i AlLL BE MUOUS

OVER BRACED WALL PANEL

FOR PANEL SPLICE (IF NEEDED)
ADJOIMING PAREL EDGES SHALL MEET
OVER AND BE FASTEMED TQ CORIMON
FRAMING

20 COMMON-BR-EAEYBEE NALS & 07
0.C, AT PANEL EDGES. FOR SINGLE
STORY AMD @ 47 0.C, PAMEL EDGES
FOR THE FIRST OF 2 STORIES

STUDS UNDER MEADER AS REQUIRED

B0 COMMOHSREAN-BOX HAR S @ 127
0.¢C AT INTERIOR SUPFORTS

1. REINF ORCING OF F QUHDATION,
QME 4 BAR TOP AND BOTTOM LAP
BARS 45 MINIFUNM,

4#:

MU FOOTING SIZE UNDER
OPENHHG 1S 127 X 12" A-THRNEB-DOWH-
“SHAE-SHALL BEFERTFTEL AT BOOR-

~GRERRG S




For ST 1 inch = 25.4 mm, 1 foot =

ORDINANCE NO. 1791

to read as follows:

Figure R602.10.6.2 of Chapter 6 of the California Residential Code is amended

- e EXTENT OF HEADER WITH DOUBLE PORYTAL FRAMES {TWO SRACED SYAML PANELS) ——-
EXTENT- O CADE R WL SINCLE FORTALTRAME
- [ORE GRASEQINALLRARNTLY
___ZM8¢ FINISHED WIDTH OF OPENBQ PABTEN KING BTUID
I " FOR S E-O02 DOUEL E PORTAL ——*1 o g:mgggwma
rrTE——— el TRMaongTRePPER R
o T o
Lt T
IIEIGI*ﬁ o b STERTHWG) TS
1
1
MIN, (1% RET BEADER STEEL HEADER PRORISIVED E | »
IF ¥ SPACER 15 \ISED, PLACE ONBACK SIDE QF HEADERSE |
3 | | SMitEEncEs Sty
1
¢ FASTEN SHEATHING TO HEADER WarH 00 i OORUR OVER AvD HE '\_FASTEM Tor
¥ CORDN B8, NAILA N ORIBY B HARED T0 Gomwe AETO
: byt PATTERN 48 SIIOWN | ouomue Rimiin T HEADER WITK
4 HEADER TO IS TUD STHAR PR AL~ (I il J,'(‘;,:rr e & OF 10
oo opm owmA R302.90.6.4 ON BOTH SIDES OF OPENING 1Y ONE ROWOF §huEr rwtsm
& & Iy o BPFONITE SI0E OF SHEATHING i N Fo
ORI i IN EACH PANEL EDGE.
F M Hhe i & 1657
¥ ] 't 1] TAIN. DOUBLE 2x1 FRARING COVERED WITH Mty §l . Mo L S\ DD
IR LHOOWoaemmw THICI\ WO STRU GTHW\LH\HELSHE‘\THL\‘G | TYRICALFORTAL v ATRICTRAL
y B MW VAT 0D GOMHON OROAMRIIER SO NAIL ¢ FRAVE GOMSTRUGTION PANEL,
8 2 o glomg:) PAALL FRANIENS (STDS, BLOGIING, Rt ' SHEATHING
h
KN-DOUBLE 2 POST
BEN_LENGTIOF PANGE PEE TADLE RE02.10.5 m:;gmwmcrsmm
» i: 9) 3500 111 SRAPTYPE HOLILDOWHS FERTABERBREOLHINS
(er Dm INTC GUINGRETE AND NAILEB INTO
' ) LW pnos 5
LSS A TOPAND BOTT i E '
7 Y .‘;ﬁ‘& EEBBEBJ:;E?) R

MiH. FOOTING SIZE UWU%I};&PENING 15 [ {2, AR ER-

I, (15 BIAMETER ANCHOR BOLT INSTALLED FER
SEGTIOM RA02.9.6 - Vil T 505t FLATE: WASHER
By a0

FRONT ELEVATION

304.8 mm.

FIGURE R&02.,10,6.2
METHOD PFH—PORTAL FRAME WITH HOLD-DOWNS

AT DETACHED GARAGE DOOR OPENINGS

SECTION

U. Table R602.10.5 of Chapter 6 of the California Remdent:al Code is amended to
read as follows:

TABLE [602.10.5
MINIMUM LENGTH OF BRACED WALL PANELS

30

MENIEALIM LENGTH?
[inches}
METHOD CONTRIBUTING LENGTH
{See Tahie RE02.70.4) Wall Helgiht {inches)
ffeet | ffeck | 10feat | Tifeel | 12feel
DWB, WSP, SEB, PBS, PCP, IIUS, BV-WSP 48 18 48 53 58 Actual?
Double sided = Actual
GB 48 4 48 53 58 Single sided = (1.5 x Actual
LIB 85 62 69 NP NP Actual®
SDC A, B ond C, ulimate
deskgn 28 32 34 38 42
ABW wind speed < 140 mph 18
SDC Dy, Dy and By, ultimyate
design 32 32 M NP NP
wind speed < 140 mph
PR Supporting roof anly 16 24 | 46 24 16 24 | 185 24| 26 240 48
Supporting one stosy and roof | 24 P! 4 27° 2g° 48
PFG 24 27 10 337 367 1.6 x Actuat’
CsSG 24 27 30 73 36 Actuni®
S.PF SDC A, BandC 16 13 i 228 24° 1.5 % Actual®
Cs- SDC Dy, By and D, 46 24| 48 4] 20 o4 | B2t 24e Actual®
{continued)




ORDINANCE NOC. 1791

Adfacent clear oponing helght
{inches)
<64 24 27 0 33 16
68 26 21 30 33 36
12 27 27 30 ] 36
6 30 29 30 33 ki)
80 32 10 30 33 16
84 38 k¥3 32 n 16
88 38 15 33 33 36
02 43 ki 35 35 36
96 48 4§ 38 36 36
CS-WSP, CS-SFB 100 — 44 40 38 38
104 — 49 43 40 30 Actual’
108 — 54 46 43 41
112 - — 40 45 43
16 — — 45 48 49
120 - - G0 52 48
124 e — - 56 5}
128 — e — 9] 54
132 e e — G6 58
136 — — — — 62
140 — - — — 66
144 — — — — 72

For Sk 1iach = 26.4 mm, 1 foot = 304.8 mam, | aile perhour = 0447 s,

NP = Not Permitied,

4. binear Interpotaton shall be pormidted.

b. Use tho achsal longtl whare 1t Is greador than or equal to the mlalmur longth.

. Maximum header helght far PEH s 10 f2et in nccerdance with Figure R602.10.6.2, butwall height shall be peemitted to be (nereased to 12 feerwith pany wall,
d. Mlaxlmum openlag helgh far PEG 13 10 feot in accondance with Figuee RED2.10.6.3, butwali helght shalt be pennitted 1o bo Inceeased 10 12 feat with pony all,
& Maximum opentng helght for ©5-FF s 10 featin accordance wilh Flgnze RE02,10.6.4, butwabl helght shall be peemitted to he Incroased to 12 feetwith pony wail,

V. Section R602.10.2.3 of Chapter 6 of the California Residential Code is amended
to read as follows:

R602.10.2.3 Minimum number of braced wall panels. Braced wall lines with a
length of 16 feet or less shall have a minimum of two braced wall panels of any
length or one braced wall panel equal to 48 inches or more. Braced wall lines
greater than 16 feet shall have a minimum of two braced wall panels. No braced
wall panel shall be less than 48 inches in length in Seismic Design Category D,
Dyand D2 and E,

31




ORDINANGE NO. 1791

W. Figure R802.10.6.4 of Chapter 6 of the California Residential Code is amended
to read as follows:

EXTERT OF AEAD ER WiTH £HGLE FORTAL FRAME
s

[Go SRACED WALL PANEL)
Z 15 FINGKED ¥l T OF OPEINNG
[T FOR SINGLE O POURLE POATAL T
' BOUREFO TENSICU 5TRAP PER
B e TABLE (02408 4 E 7
POy AL (oM OFPOSITE 510K
HEIOM T COF EHEATHING)
... BHAZED WALLLPE
L] cosTmuousLy sweated
- W %0CD STRUCTURAL 4
. FASTEN SHEATHING IO HEADER WITH IR PANELS ~
= i COMLDN CR GALVAMIED FOX HALS 1 7090 1] FASTEN TGP FLATE TO
= : PATEBUN AS SHOWH 1 HEADERWITH THO
2 t F IGENED PANEL b ﬂﬁ:ﬁr;tgérﬁ
El o] . HEADERTO A KSTUD STRAP FER TABLE  moveerr | gﬁ;‘ﬁﬁ AL s R
i U RAB2ID A CH BOTH 3IDBS OF OREN NG METAEHES 70
Z - ke CRPGSHF SILE OF SREATHIG COAMON BLOCKING
g g F WIRTH 24-OF ¥TALL ¥ stz
2 X ) : . s =]
5 i B ™S it pounE s FRAAGCOTRED v B { Y e ot fimy B iy
! ; 1502 FHETHCKIWCSD BTRUCTURAL BAIR, § BEGUALD B EXSH H 1 STAUCTURAL PAVEL
M o] L 3 SHEATHING WisLH &0 COMXTT Git DALVANZED 5 PAHEL EQGE SHEATHING
v : FOX HAIS AT 3°0.C. 14 ALL FRENNG BTUDS, H I
< RLOTHGHG. A SILS; FYR, H
2 1‘_ YYFICAL POA YL
: s M4, LENGTI GF PAEL PER TAELEAEI2 1D D AN FAARECOHETRICTIOE =
W i X Ha
L i H "
; —— 40N, (3 2 DIAETER ANCHOR DULTS i L 2e4pOST 1]
:}i Le - {HSTALLED FER [402 1.8 W ITH S2eBud 4 2-FLATE : :R!“l‘l:fxglﬁa:nclil i
ol VIASHER FEIR0.229° i HUMBER GF JaCK i
pws i STAIS PRR TAILES LW ol
T . - . RELZ O B : p
I LR |
- - - H
Pid T . a i
S e . . - . N ’ \ﬂ_ ‘i' I
i \\ﬁ ANEHOA AGLYS PER
QVER COICRETE OR FAASOHAY BLOUK FOUNDATIGH SECTIZN RS0 18 e
" 12 FRAGANG ANCHIRS
e WOCO STELC TUR AL PANEL HAL SOUE FLATE = ATPLEQ ACROSS
EATHING TOTCR OF BMIDOR 1y oot pen ¢ SHEATHING JTUET WTH A HNL SCLE
d TEBLE Rede 3 1; CAPACITY TF 610 1D5 & PLATE 1O JC15T
THE ROHZORTALAND PERTABLE
VERTZ AL DIREGCTIONS RO02 201

APFROVED BAND
CH RIK ST

HOO0 STRUCTUR AL SRAND DR RIM JOBT

OVER RAVED WOOD FLOOR . FRAMEKS ACHOR OPTIOR
{FHEN FORTAL SHEATHING DCES HOE LAP GVER DAHT DR BRI 015T)

g WOLD STRUCTURAL "

TN PAREL DAEATHING 2

sa4 . 2 HML SCLE

£ L ONTHIUSUS COVER BAND BARD OR K& JTEST WITH /— FLATE TQ Q15T
2 OR Bin 1CIST TABLE REO2HS) 0. COMNIOR HER G AT 3 FER TABLE

QL. TOP ALD BOTTOM

RW2HY

APFRCVED BANG

WOOD STHYC TURAL PANEL GHEATHING OVEA AFPROVED BANT QR RIM JOBT

RAISED WOOH) FLOGR - OVERLAR ORTIOH
WHEN PORTAL SHEATHING LAPS OVER BAND OR RILBOARD)

FROMT ELEVATION SECTION

ar Sk 1 iach = 254 mm, § foot = 304.8 mm,

FIGURE R602.10.6.4
METHOD CS-PF-CONTINUQUSLY SHEATHED PORTAL FRAME PANEL CONSTRUCTION

X. Section R606.4.4 of Chapter 6 of the California Residential Code is amended to
read as follows:

R606.4.4 Parapet walls. Unreinforced solid masonry parapet walls shall not be
used.

Y. Section R608.12.2.2.3 of Chapter 6 of the California Residential Code is
amended to read as follows:

32




BB.

CC.

DD.

ORDINANCE NO. 1791

R606.12.2.2.3 Reinforcement requirements for masonry elements. Masonry
elements listed in Section R606.12.2.2.2 shall be reinforced in either the
horizontal or vertical direction as shown in Figure R606.11(3) and in accordance
with the following:

1. Horizontal reinforcement. Horizontal joint reinforcement shall consist of at
least one No. 4 bar spaced not more than 48 inches. Horizontal
reinforcement shall be provided within 16 inches of the top and bottom of
these masonry elements.

2. Vertical reinforcement. Vertical reinforcement shall consist of at least one No.
4 bar spaced not more than 48 inches, Vertical reinforcement shall be within
8 inches of the ends of masonry walls.

Exception of Section R602.3.2 and Table R602.3.2 of Chapter 6 of the California
Residential Code is amended to read as follows:

In Seismic Design Category Do, D1 and Dz and E, a single top plate shall not be
used.

Table R602.3.2 of Chapter 6 of the California Residential Code is deleted,

Section R803.2.4 is added to Chapter 8 of the California Residential Code to
read as follows:

R803.2.4 Openings in horizontal diaphragms. Openings in horizontal
diaphragms shali conform with Section R603.2.4.

Section R806.1 of Chapter 8 of the California Residential Code fo read as
follows:

R806.1 Ventilation required. Enclosed atiics and enclosed rafter spaces
formed where ceilings are applied directly to the underside of roof rafters shall
have cross ventilation for each separate space by ventilating openings protected
against the entrance of rain or snow. Ventilation openings shall have a least
dimension of 1/16 inch minimum and 1/8 inch maximum. Ventilation openings
having a least dimension larger than 1/4 inch shall be provided with corrosion
resistant wire cloth screening, hardware cloth or similar non-combustible material
with openings having a least dimension of 1/16 inch minimum and 1/8 inch
maximum. Openings in roof framing members shall conform to the requirements
of Section R802.7. Required openings shall open directly to the outside air.

Section R902.1 of Chapter 9 of the California Residential Code is amended to
read as follows:

R902.1 Roofing covering materials. Roofs shall be covered with materials as
set forth in Sections R904 and R905. A minimum Class B minimum roofing shall

33




EE.

FF.

GG.

. HH.

ORDINANCE NO. 1791

be installed for all new structures, additions and replacement roofing. Class B
minimum roofing required by this section to be listed shall be tested in
accordance with UL 790 or ASTM E 108. Where less than 50 percent of the roof
covering is replaced within any one-year period, the new roof covering may be
Class B minimum,

CHAPTER 10 CHIMNEYS AND FIREPLACES of the 2016 Edition of the
California Residential Code is deleted and a new Chapter 10 is added to read as
foliows:

In accordance with SCAQMD’s Rule 445:

Beginning March 9, 2009, permanent indoor and cutdoor wood-burning devices
(such as fireplaces and stoves) cannot be installed in new developments.
However, open-hearth fireplaces with gas or alcohol fuel based log sets or other
popular design features that do not use wood - such as flames in river rock or
broken glass - are allowed. :

As of September 2008, permanent indoor and outdoor wood-burning devices
can only be sold or instalied in existing homes and businesses if it meets one of
these cleaner options:

Dedicated gaseous-fueled fireplace;

U.S. EPA certified fireplace insert or stove;

Pellet-fueled wood-burning heater; or

Masonry heater (not an open-hearth wood-burning fireplace).

Section AJ104 of APPENDIX J (EXISTING BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES) of
the California Residential Code is amended to read as foliows:

AJ104 Replacement windows. When replacing an existing window, the
replacement window shall comply with the requirements of CRC section R310
and the 2016 CA Energy Code.

Section A0103.3 of APPENDIX O of the California Residential Code is amended
to read as follows:

A0103.3 Vehicular gates or other barriers across required fire apparatus
access roads. The installation of gates or other barriers across a required fire
apparatus access road shall comply with the requirements set forth in the 2016
California Fire Code Section 503.6 and have approved key boxes.

The definition of “Swimming Pool” in Section AV100.1 of APPENDIX V of the
California Residential Code is amended to read as follows:

SWIMMING POOL. Any structure intended for swimming or recreation

bathing that contains water over 18 inches deep. This includes in-ground,
above-ground and on-ground swimming pools, hot tubs and spas.

34




ORDINANCE NO. 1791
il.  Section AV100.3 is hereby amended by adding a section 6 as follows:

6. If such lot or premises upon which such pool is located is vacant or
unoccupied, all gates or doors opening into the area where such pool is
located shall be kept securely locked at all times during such vacancy or non-
occupancy, whether such pool is empty or filled.

15.04.050 Amendment of Part 6, California Energy Code
A. Section 110.10(a)}{1) is hereby amended {o read as follows:

1. Single~family residences. Single-family residences shall comply with the
requirements of Section 110.10(b) through 110.10{e).

15.04.060 Amendment of Part 11, California Green Building Standards Code
A. Section A4.106.5, Table A4.106.5.1(1), Table A4.106.5.1(2), Table
A4,106.5.1(3), and Table A4.106.5.1(4) of the California Green Building
Standards Code are amended to read as follows:

A4.106.5 Cool roof for reduction of heat island effect. All roofing materials for
buildings in Gardena shall comply with this section:

Exceptions:

1. Roof constructions that have a thermal mass over the roof membrane
including areas of vegetated (green) roofs, weighing at least 25 Ibs/sf.

2. Roof areas covered by building integrated solar photovoltaic panels and
building integrated solar thermal panels,

35




TABLE A4.106.5.1(1)

ORDINANCE NO. 1791

TIER 1 -~ LOW-RISE RESIDENTIAL

C MINIMUM 3-YEAR
ROOF = CLIMATE | AGED SOLAR THERMAL
SLOPE = ZONE REFLECTANCE EMITTANCE SRI
<9272 | 33815 0.63 0.75 75
=212 | 4015 0.20 0.75 16
TABLE A4.106.6.1(2)
TIER 2 ~ LOW-RISE RESIDENTIAL
MINIMUM 3-YEAR
ROOF | CLIMATE AGED SOLAR THERMAL.
SLOPE | ZOMNE REFLECTANCE EMITTANCE SRI
£2:12 | 24616 0-650.68 85 7882
212 | 24615 0.230.28 85 2027
TABLE A4.106.5.1(3)
TIER 1 — HIGH-RISE RESIDENTIAL.
BUILDINGS, HOTELS, AND MOTELS
MINIMUM 3-YEAR
ROOF | CLIMATE AGED SOLAR THERMAL
SLOPE ZONE REFLECTANCE | EMITTANCE SRI
<2012 _9; 3 "? —44—'!, 2 0.550.63 0.75 6475
s 2012 245 0.20 0.75 16
TABLE A4.106.5.1(4)
" TIER 2~ HIGH-RISE RESIDENTIAL
BUILDINGS, HOTELS, AND MOTELS
MINIMUM 3-YEAR
ROOF | GLIMATE | AGED S0OLAR THERMAL
SLOPE ZONE REFLECTANCE EMITTANCE SRI
5212 245 0:650.68 8:-750.85 882
= 2212 215 0-230.28 0-750.85 2007

B. Section A4.303.4 of the California Green Building Standards Code is amended
to read as follows,

A4,303.4 Non-water supplied urinals. Non-water supplied urinals are installed
throughout the scope of the permit or comply with Sections 1101.1 thru 1101.8 of
the Califernia Civil Code, whichever is the most restrictive. Where approved,
hybrid urinals, as defined in Chapter 2, shall be considered waterless urinals.

to read as follows:

Section A4,407.1 of the California Green Building Standards Code is amended

A4.407.1 Drainage around foundations. Install foundation and landscape
drains which discharge to a dry well, sump, bioswale or other approved on-site

36




ORDINANCE NO. 1791
location except when not required by other state codes.

SECTION 3. Chapters 15.20 (Uniform Housing Code) and 15.24 (Abatement of
Dangerous Buildings) of the Gardena Municipal Code are hereby repealed.

SECTION 4. A new Chapter 15.20 is hereby added to the Gardena Municipal Code
fo read as follows:

15.20
INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE

15.20.010 Adoption of the 2015 International Property Maintenance Code.

Subject to the amendments set forth herein, the 2015 International Property
Maintenance Code, including Appendix A, is hereby adopted as the City of Gardena
Property Maintenance Code ("PMC”). The provisions of this Code are an alternative to
other procedures set forth in the Gardena Municipal Code relating to property
maintenance.

A. All references to the International Codes shall be to the California Building
Standards Codes, as adopted and amended by the Cily of Gardena.

B. The PMC shall be interpreted so that all responsibilities set forth in the PMC that
are attributable to either the owner or the occupant of the premises shall belong
to both the owner and the occupant of the premises, unless otherwise required
by law.

C. Section 102.3 of Chapter 1 is amended as follows:
102.3 Application of other codes.
In case of conflict with any section of the PMC and the California Building
Standards Code, the California Building Standards Code, as adopted and
amended by the City of Gardena, shall prevail regardiess of any language to the
contrary in the PMC.

D. Section 103 is hereby repealed in its entirety and replaced with the following:

SECTION 103
RESPONSIBILITY FOR PROPERTY MAINTENANCE INSPECTION

103.1 Building Official. The Building Official shall serve as the Code Official
for purposes of this Code. The Building Official may direct the Building
Inspectors or other Code Enforcement Officers of the City to carry out the
responsibilities under this Code.

E. Section 107.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

37




ORDINANCE NO. 1791

107.1 Notice to person responsible. Whenever the code official determines
that there has been a violation of this code or has grounds to believe that a
violation has occurred, notice shall be given in the manner prescribed in Sections
107.2 and 107.3 to the owner(s) and occupant(s) of the property, as well as to
any other person the code official determines is responsible for the violation as
specified in this code. Notices for condemnation procedures shall alse comply
with Section 108.3.

. Sections 111.2 through 111.8 are hereby repealed.
. The following sections of Chapter 3 are hereby deleted:

Section 302.4;
Section 302.8;
Section 302.9;
Section 303.2;
Section 304.3; and
Section 308.2.2.

e el

. Section 308.2.1 is hereby amended to read as foilows:

308.2.1 Rubbish storage facilities. All rubbish shall be disposed of in
approved covered containers.

Section 308.3.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

308.3.1 Garbage facilities. All dwelling units shall be supplied with an
approved mechanical food waste grinder, if required when the dwelling unit was
constructed or remodeled and an approved leakproof, covered, outside garbage
container. All garbage shall be disposed of by one of these two methods.

. Section 308.3.2 of Chapter 3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

308.3.2 Containers.

The operator of every establishment producing garbage shall at all times cause
to be utilized, approved leakproof containers provided with close-fitting covers for

the storage of such materials until removed from the premises for disposal.

. Section 304.14 of Chapter 3 is hereby amended by requiring insect screens 365
days a year.

. Section 404.5 of Chapter 4 is hereby amended to read as follows:

404.5 Overcrowding. Dweliing units shall not be occupied by more occupants
than permitted in accordance with the California State Building Code.

. Section 602.3 of Chapter 6 is hereby amended by requiring the heat supply to be

38




ORDINANCE NO. 1791
furnished 365 days a year.
N. Section 602.4 of Chapter 6 is hereby amended to read as follows:
602.4 Occupiable work spaces.

Indoor occupiable work spaces shall be supplied with heating 365 days a year to
maintain a minimum temperature of 68 degrees Fahrenheit during the period the
spaces are occupied.

Exceptions:

1. Processing, storage and operation areas that require cooling or special
temperature conditions.

2. Areas in which persons are primarily engaged in vigorous physical
activities.

SECTION 5. Chapter 15.30 is hereby added to the Gardena Municipal Code to read
as follows:

15.30
UNIFORM BUILDING SECURITY CODE

15.30.010 Adoption of the 1997 Uniform Building Security Code

The 1997 Uniform Building Security Code is adopted as the City of Gardena Building
Security Code.

SECTION 6. Section 8.08.020 of the Gardena Municipal Code is hereby amended
to read as foliows:

8.08.020 Los Angeles County Fire Code version.
Pursuant to Section 8.08.010, which requires the city to adopt the latest version of
the Los Angeles County Fire Code by reference, the version of the Los Angeles
County Fire Code for the city shall be the version of Title 32 of the Los Angeles
County Code as set forth in Ordinance No. 2017-003, adopted by the Los Angeles
County Board of Supervisors on January 24, 2017.

SECTION 7. Penalties.

A. Persons who shall violate a provision of the Los Angeles County Fire Code
adopted by reference in the Gardena Municipal Code, or shall fail to comply
with any of the requirements thereof, or who shall erect, install, alter, repair, or
do work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the
fire code official, or of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this code,
shall be guilty of a misdemeanor unless such violation is declared to be an
infraction by Chapter 82 of the Fire Code, punishable by a fine of not more
than $1,000 or by imprisonment not exceeding six months, or both such fine
and imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has

39




ORDINANCE NO. 1791

been served shall be deemed a separate offense. For the purposes of this
section, a forfeiture of bail shall be equivalent to a conviction.

SECTION 8. CEQA Compliance. The adoption of this Ordinance is exempt from
CEQA pursuant to CEQA Guidelines section 15061(c)(3) provides that a project is
exempt from CEQA when it is covered by the general rule that CEQA only applies to
projects which have the potential for causing a significant effect on the environment and
does not apply where it can be seen with certainty that there is no possibility of a
significant effect. This Ordinance adopts the California Building Standards Code with
local amendments as authorized by State law. The California Building Standards Code
already applies by default in the City of Gardena. The local amendments will not create
any significant effects. Additionally, the Ordinance adopts other standard code relating
to the construction and maintenance of structures within the City. These Codes protect
the public by establishing rules and regulations relating to construction and
maintenance of structures and premises and will not create any significant effects. The
adoption is exempt from the provisions of CEQA and staff shall file a Notice of

Exemption with the County Clerk.

SECTION 9. Severability. If any section, subsection, subdivision, paragraph,
sentence, clause or phrase of this ordinance, or any part thereof is for any reason held
to be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portion
of this ordinance or any part thereof. The City Council hereby declares that it would
have passed each section, subsection, subdivision, paragraph, sentence, clause or
phrase thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or more section, subsection,
subdivision, paragraph, sentence, clause or phrase be declared unconstitutional.

SECTION 10. Certification. The City Clerk shall certify to the passage of this
ordinance and shall cause the same to be entered in the book of original ordinances of
said City; shall make a minute passage and adoption thereof in the records of the
meeting at which time the same is passed and adopted; and shall, within fifteen (15)
days after the passage and adoption thereof, cause a summary of the ordinance to be

published as required by law.

SECTION 11. Effective Date. This ordinance shall become effective on the thirty-
first day after adoption. -

Passed, approved, and adopted this 27" day of March, 2018.

TASHA CERDA, Mayor

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO EQRM:

=t . /
/ Z Lyt ";L/-'J’/'”/Ly/l’fﬂy,’ﬂ——

MINA SEMENZA, City Clerk PETER L. WALLIN, City Attorney

40




STATE OF CALIFORNIA )
COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES ) ss:
CITY OF GARDENA )

I, MINA SEMENZA, City Clerk of the City of Gardena, do hereby certify that the whole number of
members of the City Council of said City is five; that the foregoing Ordinance being Ordinance
No. 1791 was duly passed and adopted by the City Council of said City of Gardena, approved
and signed by the Mayor of said City, and attested by the City Clerk, all at a meeting of said
City Council held on the 27™" day of March, 2018, and that the same was so passed and adopted

by the following roll call vote:

AYES: MAYOR PRO TEM MEDINA, COUNCIL MEMBERS KASKANIAN, HENDERSON,
AND TANAKA AND MAYOR CERDA

NOES: NONE

ABSTAIN: NONE

Becky Rovmenq

ﬁyCity Clerk of the City of Gardena, California

(SEAL)



